
  

 

NOTICE OF AWARD 

IFB #BCWS-04-15/16 

CHEMICALS USED IN WATER  

AND WASTEWATER TREATMENT 
 

The Invitation For Bids for Chemicals Used in Water and Wastewater Treatment was opened August 25, 2015 at 11:00 

AM at County Council Chamber, Room 125, 1003 Hwy. 52, Moncks Corner, South Carolina. This is one (1) year 

contract with the option to renew for two (2) additional one-year terms. Funding was approved in the BCWS Budget 

Fiscal Year 15/16. 

Bidder cost w/ 8% tax unit cost w/ 8% tax unit cost w/ 8% tax unit cost w/ 8% tax unit cost w/ 8% tax unit

Brenntag Mid-South 

Inc.
No Bid per lb. 0.081$          per lb. 1.0368$        per lb. No Bid per lb. No Bid per gallon

Chemrite, Inc. No Bid per lb. 0.0826$        per lb. No Bid per lb. 1.4796$        per lb. No Bid per gallon

Airgas National 

Welders
1.512$          per lb. No Bid per lb. 1.512$          per lb. No Bid per lb. No Bid per gallon

Allied Universal Corp. 0.756$          per lb. 0.081$          per lb. 0.8280$        per lb. 1.2852$  per lb. 0.9504$        per gallon

JCI Jones Chemicals 0.6102$  per lb. 0.0875$        per lb. 0.81$      per lb. No Bid per lb. 0.8424$  per gallon

No Bid per lb. 0.0733$  per lb. No Bid per lb. 1.7172$        per lb. 0.9277$        
 per gallon (Tri-

lite 150) 

0.8629$        
 per gallon (Tri-

lite 100) 

Leslie's Poolmart, Inc. No Bid per lb. No Bid per lb. No Bid per lb. 1.566$          per lb. No Bid per gallon

Univar USA, Inc.

Gaseous Sulfer Dioxide Calcium Hypochlorite Sodium HypochloriteGaseous Chlorine Liquid Caustic

 

Awarded Bid to the lowest and responsive bidder:  

JCI Jones Chemicals – Gaseous Chlorine, Gaseous Sulfer Dioxide, Sodium Hypochlorite 

Univar USA, Inc. – Liquid Caustic 

Allied Universal Corp. – Calcium Hypochlorite 


